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Pharmacy In Edinburgh

Dears Pharmacy & Travel Clinic - Edinburgh
    
Dears Pharmacy & Travel Clinic in Edinburgh

  Dears Pharmacy & Travel Clinic, located in the heart of Edinburgh, is a notable
establishment known for its service options and commitment to customer
satisfaction.  

Accessibility Features

  One of the standout features of Dears Pharmacy is its wheelchair-accessible
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entrance. This attention to accessibility ensures that all customers, regardless
of mobility challenges, can comfortably enter and navigate the pharmacy.  

Quick Visit Service

  For those in need of a quick visit, Dears Pharmacy offers efficient services that
minimize waiting times. Customers appreciate the ability to get what they need
without unnecessary delays, making it an ideal spot for both regular
prescriptions and emergency needs.  

Delivery Options

  Dears Pharmacy understands the importance of convenience and offers 
delivery services. This option is especially beneficial for individuals who may
have difficulty visiting the pharmacy in person.  

Payment Methods

  When it comes to payments, Dears Pharmacy strives to accommodate various
customer preferences. They accept credit cards, providing flexibility and ease
during transactions.  

Customer Feedback

  Feedback from visitors has been mixed. While some customers have noted the 
moody staff, others have highlighted the staff's helpfulness in addressing their
inquiries and concerns. This indicates that experiences may vary, but overall,
the pharmacy’s focus remains on serving the community effectively.  

Planning Your Visit

  If you're planning your visit to Dears Pharmacy & Travel Clinic, keep in mind
their service options and the accessibility features that make it easy for
everyone to use their facilities. Whether you require medication refills or health
consultations, Dears Pharmacy aims to meet your needs efficiently.     
We are positioned at

  
 55a-57a, 57a Mayfield Rd, EH9 3AA  Edinburgh,  - United Kingdom  (GB) 
 
     
 
The contact line of the mentioned Pharmacy  is +441316671992
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+441316671992
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https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=55.9305294%2C-3.1760607#map=15/55.9305294/-3.1760607
tel:+441316671992
https://wa.me/+598+441316671992


 

We look forward to seeing you at:

    Day Hours    Monday 9?AM–5:30?PM   Tuesday 9?AM–5:30?PM   Wednesday 9?AM–1?PM   Thursday Closed   Friday 9?AM–5:30?PM   Saturday 9?AM–5:30?PM   Sunday 9?AM–5:30?PM        The website is Dears Pharmacy & Travel Clinic       In case you want to modify any data that you feel is not precise concerning
this page, we ask deliver a message and we will correct it as soon as possible.
Thank you in advance thanks. 
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